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Foreword 
ROBERT CHAMBERS 

The Myth of Community fills a huge gap. With hindsight, the previous lack 
of a book like this appears little short of spectacular. During the past two 
decades, the two powerful but separate movements, of gender and of parti-
cipation, have been transforming the rhetoric, and increasingly the reality, 
of local-level development. Each has generated much writing. Each has 
major implications for the other. Yet, astonishingly, to the best of my 
knowledge, this is the first book thoroughly to explore the overlaps, link-
ages, contradictions, and synergies between the two. It cannot be often that 
a vital gap cries out for so long to be filled; and that it is then filled so well, 
with such rich material and insight, and with so much of the excitement of 
significant discovery, as in this book. 

Its importance can be understood against the background of the two 
movements. 

First, gender and development has had an immense influence. In many 
ways - in rhetoric and syntax, in appointments and promotions, in organ-
izational behaviour, in projects, programmes and policies, and above all in 
personal awareness and orientation - a tidal change has started and con-
tinues. At the personal level, many of us development professionals have 
been both threatened and liberated as we become more aware of the 
pervasive inequities of the socially constructed relations between women 
and men, and recognize the personal implications for ourselves. To be sure, 
there is far still to go; and whether we are women or men, we will always 
have much to learn and unlearn, and much to work to change. But in 
development thinking and action, the direction is clear. Gender awareness 
and equity are irreversibly on the agenda and increasingly pursued in 
practice. 

For its part, participation has origins which go far back. It has, though, 
only recently come together in the mainstream of development discourse 
and action. Both donor agencies and governments now have policies to 
promote it. At the same time, methodologies for participatory develop-
ment, among them PRA (originally participatory rural appraisal), have 
evolved and spread, presenting new opportunities and means for turning 
the rhetoric into reality. Participation, like gender, presents challenges and 
opportunities across a wide front. Not least these are institutional, to 
change organizations, and personal, to change individual behaviour and 
attitudes. 

To explore and share experiences and ideas about gender and participa-
tion, Irene Guijt and Meera Shah convened a two-day workshop at the 
Institute of Development Studies (IDS) at the University of Sussex, UK in 
December 1993. It was one of a series on PRA organized jointly by IDS 



and the International Institute for Environment and Development, Lon-
don. This book originates in the discussions and papers of that workshop. 
Papers have been updated and revised; others have been added; and the 
scope has been widened beyond PRA to include participatory approaches 
more broadly. 

There is here a rich and diverse harvest for the reader. Across the board, 
the contributions offer insights. The direct personal experiences of the 
writers present an immediacy and realism which carries conviction. The 
realities described invite reflection. They provoke review and revision of 
one's sense of what is right and what is doable. Each reader will draw out 
her or his own themes and lessons. For me, four stand out. 

First, there are many biases to be recognized and offset. Attitudes and 
behaviours which are dominating and discriminatory are common among 
those of us who are men: to become aware of these is a first and often 
difficult step. Even when the application of participatory methodologies is 
intended to minimize biases, women are often marginalized. Again and 
again, women are excluded by factors like time and place of meeting, 
composition of groups, conventions that only men speak in public, out-
siders being only or mainly men, and men talking to men. In communities, 
it is easier for men than women to find the undisturbed blocks of time 
needed for PRA mapping, diagramming, discussions and analysis. The 
times best for women to meet, sometimes late after dark, are often incon-
venient for outsiders. When outsiders rush, make short visits, do not stay 
the night, and come only once or twice, it is typically difficult for local 
women to participate, and issues of gender are likely to be marginalized or 
excluded. Again and again, the cases cited in this book are, in contrast, 
based on repeated, sustained and sensitive contact and interaction. Recog-
nizing and offsetting these biases requires sensitivity, patience and commit-
ment on the part of those who are outsiders to a community. 

Second, local contexts are complex, diverse and dynamic. The reduction-
ism of collective nouns misleads: 'community' hides many divisions and 
differences, with gender often hugely significant; 'women' as a focus dis-
tracts attention from gender relations between women and men, and from 
men themselves; and 'women' also conceals the many differences between 
females by age, class, marital status and social group. Nor are common 
beliefs valid everywhere: female-headed households are often the worst 
off, but not always. Moreover, social relations change, sometimes fast. It is 
not just the myth of community that this book dispels, but other myths of 
simple, stable and uniform social realities. 

Third, conflict is sometimes necessary and positive for good change. For 
gender equity, much that needs to change concerns the power and priority 
of males over females. Several contributions to this book strikingly con-
front consensual participation as a myth, at least in the short term. They 
show that conflict can be an essential and creative factor in change for the 
better. Common examples are tackling issues of power and control over 
resources, and dealing with aggressive and violent behaviour. Domestic 
violence, drunken husbands, female infanticide, discrimination against 
females of all ages - these are phenomena difficult to confront without 
conflict. This does not mean a negative sum in well-being, that for females 
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lo gain, males must lose. To cease to dominate, oppress or be violent is 
itself a liberation. Responsible well-being is enhanced in shared respon-
sibilities, in good relations in the family, in social harmony, and in personal 
peace of mind. The key is to facilitate changes in gender relations which 
lead to a positive sum, in which all come to feel better off, and so in which 
all gain. 

Fourth, issues of ethics are repeatedly posed by both gender and particip-
ation: whether outsiders' interventions are based on universally valid 
values or a form of cultural domination; whether working with those who 
are weak and vulnerable leads to bad results for them, as when women are 
beaten by their husbands when the outsider leaves; whether gender-
sensitive participation leads in practice to women and girls being better off 
or through a backlash worse off than before. There seem to be no easy 
answers. The imperative is to consult women and girls, and sometimes 
men, and seek their views on what it is right and practicable to do; it is to 
recognize the dilemmas of where values conflict, to puzzle and worry about 
them, and in a spirit of pluralism to act according to what seems best in 
each context, struggling to act well through self-aware judgement which 
respects the rights and realities of others. 

Strikingly, these four themes all point to personal behaviour, attitudes, 
values and commitment. This is evident in many of the contributions. It 
applies to all of us who seek to intervene and influence the lives of others, 
whether through research, facilitation, sensitization or other development 
actions. In offsetting biases, this means working for gender equity, reducing 
dominance by men, and meeting, listening to and learn from women in 
places and at times they find convenient. In the local context it means being 
sensitive to social diversity and complexity in various dimensions of social 
difference, including, though not exclusively, gender. In conflict it means 
being alert and exercising good judgement in facilitating and managing 
process and mediating negotiation, resolving differences and nurturing re-
lationships in which those who lose in one way gain in others. In ethical 
issues, it means consulting women, girls and others who are weak, and 
continual self-questioning, not to the point of paralysis, but reflecting on 
values, combining commitment with being open to self-doubt, and learning 
and changing oneself. 

It is in this spirit that personal sensitivity pervades this book. The insights 
into gender relations and into participation are nuanced. The presentations 
are balanced, insightful and persuasive. The experience, evidence and anal-
ysis are often fascinating, recognizing and celebrating differences. The ten-
sions and difficulties encountered with gender have generated concepts, 
methods and understandings which are subtle, and which ground participa-
tion in a deeper realism. 

Now that we have this book, it deserves the widest distribution and 
readership. For those who specialize in gender, it opens up participation. 
For those who specialize in participation, it reinforces the gender dimen-
sion in full measure. For all other development professionals - whether 
academics, researchers or trainers, whether field practitioners, managers, 
consultants or policy-makers, and whether in government organizations, 
bilateral or multilateral donor agencies, or international or national 
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NGOs - it offers readable access to new development needs and 
opportunities. 

The Myth of Community takes us - development professionals - a long 
step forward. After this, 'gender' and 'participation' can never be quite the 
same again. Let me hope that this book will be read, reread and reflected 
on, and that its insights will permeate and help to transform development 
theory and practice. The editors and authors would never claim to have 
made a final or definitive statement. They have, though, covered so much 
new ground so well and so convincingly that the good impact of their work 
should be deep and lasting. In our world, hundreds of millions are mar-
ginalized, oppressed and made miserable by domination and exclusion. 
Most of them are women. May those who read this book be inspired to act 
to reduce their marginalization, oppression and misery and to help rela-
tions between women and men change for the better. For gender equity 
and participation have, together, a huge potential for enhacing well-being 
for all. 
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